


Item No.: 16

CITY OF LOS ANGELES
CLAIMS BOARD

RECOMMENDATION OF THE CLAIMS BOARD
FOR CONSIDERATION BY THE CITY COUNCIL

The Honorable City Council
City of Los Angeles

Room 395, City Hall

200 North Spring Street
Los Angeles, CA 90012

Honorable Members:

At its meeting on November 7, 2022, the Claims Board of the City of Los

Angeles considered a report of the Department of Building and Safety in
the matter of:

Refund Claim from Louisiana Glen — LP- Linkage Fees re: Claim No. 160235

and voted ( 2/0 ) that your Honorable Body (approve/reject) the recommendation of
the Department of Building and Safety.

Other action:

Claims Board, City of Los Angeles

By: /s/ Kellilyn Porter
Chairperson

cc: City Attorney



11/7/22, 2:52 PM City of Los Angeles Mail - 11/7/22 Claims Board

Margarit Avesyan <margarit.avesyan@lacity.org>

11/7/22 Claims Board

Kelli Porter <kelli.porter@lacity.org> Mon, Nov 7, 2022 at 2:47 PM
To: Margarit Avesyan <margarit.avesyan@]Iacity.org>

The Claims Board approved items 2-21 by 2/0

Kellilyn Porter
Assistant City Attorney
Claims and Risk Management Division

City Hall East 1 200 N. Main Street, 8th Floor I Los Angeles, CA 900121 (213) 978-8373

*****************Confidentiality Notice *hkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkk

This electronic message transmission contains information

from the Office of the Los Angeles City Attorney, which may be confidential or protected by the attorney-client privilege
and/or the work product doctrine. If you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying,

distribution or use of the content of this information is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original message and any attachments without reading or saving in any
manner.
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Louisiana Glen; LP & its attorney, The Law Office of Steve Hoffman

C/O The Law Office of Steve Hoffman, 4929 Wilshire Bivd., Suite 410, Los Angeles, CA 90010

(323) 997-1188

REFEND INCORNMIATION

108 LocaTion: 10405 Louisiana Ave, Los Angeles, CA 90025
(LADBS has been closed to public for Covid 19)
Amount Claimed $9155,004.67 Date Fees Paid: 12/13/21 (Submitted 6/4/19 fee is 2/

19010 - 10000 - 02347 and 19019 - 30000 - 01428

RECEIPT #/PERMIT #/REFERENCE #:

See attached letter + Exhibits documenting that we are owed a Linkage Fee refund of $155,004.57.
We were charged on gross sq footage of 30,686 instead of Net of 18,686 after 12,000 demo.
Because of the attached attorney's fee lien, please make the check payable to:

'Louisiana Glen, LP & Law Office of Steve Hoffman™ and mail to 4929 Wilshire Bivd., #410, L.A.,, CA 90010

NOTE: A Claimant sy be required to submit 10 examination under outh. (Churter Section 217.)
Presentation of & false clyim is a felony . (Californis Penal Code Section 72.)

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE S]'ATFME!STS}RETRUE

Steve Hoffman, Es A 27
Attorney for Louisiaha Glen, LP " v ‘;,i/ 7 . / December 22 2021
SIGNATLURE AND JUTTHEOF CLAIMANT ' o / P \ nart
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As a covered entity under Title 11 of the Amencans with Disabilities Act. the City of Los Angeles does not discriminate on the basis of
disability and. upon request, will provide reasonable accommodation to ensure equal access o its programs, services and activilies
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9/27/122, 2:35 PM Refund Claims

Tuesday, September 27, 2022 14 : 35 PM
LADBS Recommendation Form

CLAIM # 160235 1 Document Number: 19010-10000-02347
Bureau: Engineering - K Receipt Number:
Division: Green Building f Receipt Date:

Fee Period:

Job Address: 10405 Louisiana AVE 90025

1. Did LADBS perform any work for which the permit or receipt was issued?
yes

,: 2. Are the reasons given by claimant correct?
' yes

= RS ATR AT ———

' 3. Did LADBS initiate an action that resulted in an error?
i yes ,

i The linkage fee should have been calculated based on the net new floor area after deducting the demolished floor area.

LT L e e ——%" o

4. |s this a duplicated permit or receipt of the same job or item?
no

5. Of the gross amount claimed, is the amount claimed pertaining to the(se) particular item(s) correct?
no
Rate used to calculate linkage fee was $19.36, with a 2/3 phase in factor applied after calculation. Refund should be based on 12000 sf of
demolished floor area. Refund amount should be: 12000 sf x $19.36 x 2/3 = $154,880.00 ~

6. Is a refund recommended?
yes 7
The linkage fee should have been calculated based on the net new floor area after deducting the demolished fioor area.

Reviewed By: TEODORO DIAZ RODRIGUEZ Financial Service Div.'s Comments:
Reviewed On: 09/23/2022
Approved By: CHARMIE HUYNH
Approved On: 09/26/2022

Review Again and read email of 7/5/2022.
Liaison's Comments:

Reviewer's Comments:
Supervisor's Comments:

History

Action By On

Review Approved & Returned to FSD CHARMIE HUYNH 9/26/2022 11:24:41 AM
Review Completed & Submitted for Supervisor Review (to CHARMIE TEODORO DIAZ RODRIGUEZ 9/23/2022 10:14:19 AM
HUYNH)

Assigned (to TEODORO DIAZ RODRIGUEZ) MARGARET KUHN 7/6/2022 6:52:39 AM
Created MARY SUM 77512022 4:51:32 PM

https://vm-08wnetapp01/ClaimForRefund/EditView/RecomendFormPrint 171












STEVE A. HOFFMAN

Attorney At Law
4929 Wilshire Boulevard, Suite 410 Los Angeles, CA 90010

PHONE: (323) 997-1188 FAX: (323) 937-1539
Email: hoffpi@sbeglobal.net Website: wwi.Hoffmanpi.com

DESIGNATION. LIEN, PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
ION TO REL

Louisiana Glen, LP hereby designates attorney Steve A. Hoffman to represent it in obtaining

the linkage fee refund for 10405 Louisiana Ave, Los Angeles, CA 90025. It further consents to have the

City and LADBS, release to Steve A. Hoffman, Esq.'s office, documents and information, regarding

this matter.

LIEN: It grants Steve Hoffinan, Esq. a lien on its linkage fee refunds for 10405 Louisiana Ave,

Los Angeles. CA 90025 and irrevocably requests that the refund check(s) be payable to
Louisiana Glen, LP & attorney Steve A, Hoffman Trust Account” and mailed to Steve

Hoffman, Esq:, at 4929 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 410, Los Angeles, CA 90010. This Jien is only on the

refunds/ove men rope

zad, Managing Officer of Louisiana Glen, LP /
\e




10405 W Louisiana Ave 1 - 16

19010 - 10000 - 02347

Printed: 12/17/21 02:45PM

Permit #:
Plan Check #: BISLA11414

Event Code:

Bldg-New GREEN - MANDATORY
Apartment

12/13/2021

Last Status: Issued

City of Los Angeles - Department of Building and Safety Issued on:

APPLICATION FOR BUILDING PERMIT

Regular Plan Check

Plan Check AND CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY Status Date; 12/13/2021

LIRACT BLOCK LOTis\ ARE COUNTY MAPREF# PARCELID #{PIN #) || 2, ASSESSORPARCEL#
TR 5609 137 23 M B 76-68/71 (SHTS 13-1129B157 417 4317-012-061
TR 5609 137 22 M B 76-68/71 (SHTS 13-1129B157 439 4317 - 012 - 061
3. PARCEL INFORMATION

Area Planning Commission - West Los Angeles
LADBS Branch Office - WLA

Coungil District - 5

Certified Neighborhood Council - Westside
Community Plan Arca - West Los Angeles

Methane Hazard Site - Methane Zone
Near Source Zone Distance - 0.7
Thomas Brothers Map Grid - 632-D4

Census Tract - 2671.00

District Map - 129B157

Energy Zone -9

Flood Haz. Zone - AO D=3 E=N/A IN
Hillside Grading Area - YES

ZONES(s): R3-1-O

4, DOCUMENTS

Z1 - ZI-2192 WLA Transportation Impro ORD - ORD-129279
SPA - West LA Transportation Improver ORD - ORD-147819

ORD - ORD-171492 CPC - CPC-9826
ORD - ORD-183497

CPC - CPC-1974-25468-A

Special Inspect - Concrete>2.5ksi
Special Inspect - Structural Observation

RENT - YES ORD - ORD-163205
ORD - ORD-114517 ORD - ORD-171227 CPC - CPC-2014-1457-SP
S.CHECKLIST ITEMS

Flood Certif. - Flood Elevation Certif. Req'd

Permit Flag - Rec and Parks Fee Memo Reqd

Special Inspect - Structural Wood (periodic)
Std. Work Descr - Seismic Gas Shut Off Valve

Fabricator Reqd - Prefabricated Joist
Permit Flag - Fire Life Safety Clearnce Reqd

Owner(s)
LOUISIANA GLEN LP 11601 SANTA MONICA BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90025
Tenant:
Applicant: (Relationship: Agent for Owner)
DON TOLENTINO - (310) 914.5555
Z_EXISTING USE PROPOSED USE 8. DESCRIPTION QK WORK
(05) Apartment (N) 4 STORY 16 UNIT APARTMENT
(07) Garage - Private
9. # Bldes on Site & Use: l For inspection requests, call toll-free (888) LA4BUILD (524-2845).

10, APPLICATION PROCESSING INFORMATION
BLDG. PC By: Heman Arreola

or request inspections via www.ladbs.org. To speak to a Call Center
agent, call 311 Outside LA County, call(213) 473-3231.

DAS PC By: Elizabeth Toms

OK for Cashier: Derrick Magee Coord. OK:
) _ For Cashier's Use Only W/O #: 91002347

Signature: Date:
11._PROJECT YALUATION & FEE INFORMATION Final Fee Period
Permit Valuation: $4,932,122 ) PC Valuation: e .
FINAL TOTAL Bldg-New 560,000.34 Dwelling Unit Construction Tax 3,200.00
Permit Fee Subtotal Bldg-New 19,847.24 Residential Development Tax 4,800.00
Energy Surcharge CA Bidg Std Commission Surchar 198.00
Handicapped Access Green Building
Plan Check Subtotal Bldg-New 3,651.29 Permit Issuing Fee 0.00
Plan Maintenance 300.00 Linkage Fee 396,053.97

E.Q. Instrumentation

D.S.C. Surcharge

Sys. Surcharge

Planning Surcharge

Planning Surcharge Misc Fee
Planning Gen Plan Maint Surcharg
School District Residential Level 1

Sewer Cap ID:

Payment Date: 12/13/21

1,380.99
755.39 Receipt No: 2021347003-3
Ibro Amount: $560,000.34
"10.00 Method: ICL Check
1,665.90
125,198.88 2021WL00424

Total Bond(s) Due:

12, ATTACHMENTS
Owner-Builder Declaration
Plot Plan

Signed Declaration

1 00

[
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1/6/22, 3:17 PM

https;//ucs.insidela.org/ladbs_prod/my/0/0/0/a_search_result/network_printer _print.htm?__DOUBLESUBMIT__=J9M%2fPgGyHJn...

1828 Sawtelle Blvd., 2nd Floor
West Los Angeles, CA 90025

Receipt
Your Reference Number:
2021347003-3
12/13/2021 3:16:51 PM
jblockson

TRANSACTIONS
LADBS PERMIT
2021347003-3-1

Name: DON TOLENTINO

Job Address: 10405 W LOUISIANA AVE 1 16

Permit Number: 19010-10000-02347
Building Permit Reference Number: 2021WL00424

Dwelling Unit Construction Tax
Sys. Surcharge

Planning Surcharge

Planning Gen Plan Maint Surcharge
Planning Surcharge Misc Fee
Permit Issuing Fee

Linkage Fee

Residential Development Tax

CA Bldg Std Commission Surcharge
School District Residential Level 1
Permit Fee Subtotal Bldg-New
Plan Check Subtotal Bldg-New
Plan Maintenance

E.Q. Instrumentation

D.S.C. Surcharge

LADBS PERMIT
2021347003-3-3

Name: DON TOLENTINO
Job Address: 10405 W LOUISIANA AVE
Permit Number: 19026-10000-00310

Building Permit Reference Number: 2021WL00425

CA Bldg Std Commission Surcharge
Planning Gen Plan Maint Surcharge
Permit Fee Subtotal Nonbldg-Alter/Repair
Plan Check Subtotal Nonbldg-Alter/Repair
E.Q. Instrumentation

D.S.C. Surcharge

Sys. Surcharge

Planning Surcharge

Planning Surcharge Misc Fee

Permit Issuing Fee

LADBS PERMIT
2021347003-3-5
Name: DON TOLENTINO
Job Address: 10405 W LOUISIANA AVE

Permit Number: 19030-10000-03526
Building Permit Reference Number: 2021WL00426

Permit Fee Subtotal Grading

Plan Check Subtotal Grading
D.S.C. Surcharge

Planning Gen Plan Maint Surcharge
Planning Surcharge Misc Fee

$560,000.34

$3200.00
$1510.77
$1427.91
$1665.90
$10.00
$0.00
$396053.97
$4800.00
$198.00
$125198.88
$19847.24
$3651.29
$300.00
$1380.99
$755.39

$760.39

$1.00
$42.56
$320.00
$288.00
$7.00
$18.45
$36.90
$36.48
$10.00
$0.00

$2,968.50

$2425.00
$0.00
$72.75
$169.75
$10.00

https://ucs.insidela.orgfladbs_prod/my/0/0/0/a_search_result/network_printer -~ printhtim?__DOUBLESUBMIT__=J9M%2fPgGyHJnCMmBqO0bO0t1x6pG. ..
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1/6/22, 3:18 PM X Image Display CORE Admin Center iPayment Enterprise 4.5.1.5.0_rv55583

iPayment Reference Number:

2021347003-3
Effective Date 12/13/2021
Workgroup West Los Angeles
User jblockson
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116122, 3:19 PM ‘ Image Display CORE Admin Center iPayment Enterprise 4.5.1.5.0_rv55583

iPayment Reference Number:

2021347003-3
Effective Date 12/13/2021

User jblockson
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	Claim #160235 package approved
	Kelli_s email - 11-07-22 - All Items 2-21 are approved 2-0



